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The Bachelor’s Degree in Finance and Banking 
covers one of the eight most  important fields in 
modern business: those in which today’s compa-
nies are founded and by which they formulate 
their growth and consolidation plans. The follow-
ing are some details about the degree.

You will develop the knowledge, skills and attitudes 
specific to finance and banking, to participate 
successfully in the organization.

You will learn to design investment strategies and 
portfolios to trade financial assets and build value 
for the organization with the lowest risk possible.

You will evaluate different financing and investment 
alternatives available in the financial system based 
on your organization’s needs for the short and long 
term, in keeping with existing financial regulations.

You will design investment and finance strategies 
through definition of optimum value and risk 
management.

You will know how to manage risk through quantita-
tive and qualitative evaluation,  and to  take action 
to minimize, mitigate and/or transfer that risk.

You will use quantitative and financial tools and 
methodologies to support the company’s strategic 
decisions.

You will be capable of designing financial 
strategies to make companies profitable and 
increase their earnings while managing risk, 
making you an invaluable asset to the organiza-
tion. With you managing and controlling its 
finances, the business can compete in the market 
on solid footing, to grow and consolidate.

To strengthen you professionally, the subjects 
you’ll study in the Bachelor’s Degree in Finance 
and Banking are divided up into distinct areas of 
preparation, each of them intended to make sure 
that the knowledge you acquire becomes, in 
practice, a way to distinguish yourself in any 
organization.


